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Abstract 
Pediatricians have obligations to respond with care to all children’s 
clinical and social vulnerabilities. Finding and addressing causes of 
children’s stress (ie, family separation, child abuse, and trauma) are also 
obligations. Preventive and rescue interventions should be implemented 
to address potential short- and long-term harms of toxic stress and their 
short- and long-term consequences. 

 
To claim one AMA PRA Category 1 CreditTM for the CME activity associated with this article, you must do the 
following: (1) read this article in its entirety, (2) answer at least 80 percent of the quiz questions correctly, 
and (3) complete an evaluation. The quiz, evaluation, and form for claiming AMA PRA Category 1 CreditTM 
are available through the AMA Ed HubTM. 
 
Case 
Dr A practices primary care in a US plains state that is home to many recent Honduran 
refugees. HH is an 11-year-old patient brought to the free clinic by their mother for a 
routine check-up. Dr A greets HH and HH’s mother and interviews HH, who does not 
make eye contact. Dr A confirms that HH doesn’t hurt anywhere, is eating well, and 
attends school. “Are you sleeping all right?” 
 
HH shrugs. HH’s mother states, “It has been hard on my children,” and explains why the 
family recently fled Honduras. HH’s ancestors lived on land now known as Honduras for 
centuries until recent political upheaval made life there intolerable. HH’s father was 
murdered near their home. This necessitated that the remaining family members leave 
Honduras on foot and seek asylum by crossing through Mexico and entering the United 
States. At the US border, they were separated and detained for several weeks. HH’s 
family members were each granted asylum and have been staying with cousins. 
 
HH’s mother begins to cry after saying, “I don’t know what would’ve happened to us if 
we didn’t have any cousins here.” 
 
HH begins to cry, too, but does not want to speak with a counselor. Dr A wonders how to 
respond. 
 

https://edhub.ama-assn.org/ama-journal-of-ethics/module/2780532
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Commentary 
Pediatricians have obligations to respond with care to all children’s clinical and social 
vulnerabilities. Yet pediatricians might feel unprepared to deal with the complexity of 
care for refugees and immigrants. While providing care to HH, Dr A should address all 
their immediate medical needs while ensuring that all factors that affect well-being are 
taken into consideration, including the trauma that HH and their mother have 
experienced. The National Child Traumatic Stress Network (NCTSN) outlines 7 principles 
of trauma-informed care: (1) “Routinely screen for trauma exposure and related 
symptoms,” given the high prevalence of trauma in children; (2) use evidence-based, 
culturally sensitive tools for assessment and treatment of traumatic stress and 
associated mental health symptoms; (3) “make resources available to children, families, 
and providers on trauma exposure, its impact, and treatment”; (4) “engage in efforts to 
strengthen the resilience and protective factors of children and families” that have been 
affected by trauma; (5) address trauma in both parents and caregivers and address its 
impact on the family; (6) “emphasize continuity of care and collaboration across child-
service systems”; and (7) “maintain an environment of care for staff that addresses, 
minimizes, and treats secondary traumatic stress.”1 These principles are recommended 
as practical guidelines to ensure that clinicians recognize and respond to the impact of 
trauma. Discussion of this case considers how clinicians can recognize, assess, and 
respond to trauma. 
 
Clinical Assessment 
Trauma. Dr A is probably aware of the high prevalence of trauma in immigrants, 
refugees, and children who have experienced separation from their parents.2 The case 
relates that HH is not making eye contact. Dr A should consider several reasons for HH’s 
lack of eye contact, including trauma and conditions such as anxiety, depression, and 
posttraumatic stress disorder (PTSD). Dr A appropriately asks about HH’s sleep as part 
of the routine interview but perhaps also as a way to start assessing for HH’s experience 
of and response to trauma. Children with any of these conditions typically present with 
various sleep problems: difficulties in falling asleep, middle-of-the night awakenings, 
difficulty falling back asleep, disruption in sleeping patterns and schedules, or 
oversleeping.3 Dr A also assessed the child’s appetite and eating patterns, as many 
children with emotional distress, depression, anxiety, or PTSD will present with appetite 
changes or disruption in eating patterns.4 Dr A confirms that HH is eating well. 
Identifying and addressing the causes of emotional distress is an obligation for any 
pediatrician. Different causes must be considered, including family separation, child 
abuse, and trauma. Often, the first sign of emotional distress, anxiety, depression, or 
PTSD is a change in school attendance or school performance. Although in this case 
vignette HH is attending school, the case does not include complete information 
pertaining to HH’s school attendance and academic performance. Also important are 
HH’s social interactions. Does HH have friends at school? Does HH see their friends 
outside of school? What do they do together in their free time inside or outside of 
school? 
 
HH’s mother describes several stressful events that the family has endured recently, 
including the violent loss of HH’s father, family members’ need to leave their home 
country and pursue asylum, and the separation and detention that they experienced at 
the border. HH’s mother cries while describing these events. While her emotional 
reaction is appropriate, Dr A, as a pediatrician, has to wonder whether HH’s mother 
herself is experiencing emotional distress, depression, anxiety, or PTSD. Dr A thus 
should also address HH’s mother’s experience of trauma when addressing HH’s 

https://journalofethics.ama-assn.org/article/how-should-health-care-professionals-address-social-determinants-refugee-health/2019-03
https://journalofethics.ama-assn.org/article/medical-evaluations-asylum-seekers/2004-09
https://journalofethics.ama-assn.org/article/medical-evaluations-asylum-seekers/2004-09
https://journalofethics.ama-assn.org/article/rights-disappear-when-us-policy-engages-children-weapons-deterrence/2019-01
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problems. If indicated, Dr A should refer HH’s mother to a therapist and help her 
connect with resources that would help both her and HH. Studies have documented how 
the presence of trauma, emotional distress, anxiety, depression, or PTSD in parents 
affects the well-being of their children.5 When left untreated, these conditions can 
undermine healthy parenting.5 
 
Counseling referral. Although HH does not want to speak with a counselor, it is 
extremely important for the care of both HH and their mother to include behavioral 
support. HH might have feelings of guilt, shame, and avoidance that can make obtaining 
the history of trauma difficult.6 HH’s developmental stage and limitations in memory and 
language might also alter HH’s capability to share details of past experiences and 
trauma from the death of their father, leaving their home country, crossing the border, 
being separated from their mother, and now adapting to a new home and a new 
country.7 Dr A should refer HH to a therapist. Although many free clinics might not have 
therapists who provide counseling on-site, a reasonable recommendation is to have a 
list of potential local therapists who can offer services pro bono or on a sliding-scale fee. 
Some of these resources could be obtained through local colleges and universities or 
through federally qualified health centers. Therapists might employ different techniques 
to engage and elicit communication from children who have experienced trauma. These 
techniques might include play therapy, drawing, or reenacting. It is important to take into 
account that HH’s distressing memories and emotions are likely to resurface when 
describing the traumatic events that they have endured.8 Therapists and other members 
of the treating team should share the child’s primary language or use linguistically 
appropriate resources (eg, certified interpreters) and developmentally appropriate 
techniques as well as show cultural awareness. 
 
Child abuse. Consideration should always be given to the possibility of child abuse by 
any caregiver—in this case, by HH’s mother or other adults that cared for HH while HH 
was separated from their mother, such as immigration officers. Red flags include, but 
are not limited to, lesions discovered upon physical examination, reports of physical or 
sexual abuse made by HH or their mother, or unexpected or unusual behaviors, such as 
hypersexual activity. All 50 states have laws requiring reporting of child abuse, and 46 
states have criminal penalties for failure to report child abuse.9 
 
Persecution or torture. Frequently, asylum cases require or include forensic 
evaluations.10 A pediatrician can ethically undertake a forensic evaluation. Indeed, 
pediatricians are in a unique position to perform forensic asylum evaluations, as they 
know all the conditions of their patients and can be the best advocates for the well-
being of their patients. 
 
Long-Term Effects 
HH’s long-term health and cognitive and physical development might be hindered by 
their experiences following departure from their home country, especially the mutual 
separation that HH and their mother endured. During the time of their separation, 
probably neither HH nor their mother knew if or when they would be reunited and both 
suffered from toxic stress. It is well established that childhood stressors, including 
detention and family separation, are harmful to a child’s well-being and development, 
putting the child at lifelong risk for negative physical and mental health 
consequences.2,11,12,13 While experiencing toxic stress, both HH and their mother were, 
and might still be, in survival mode. Their brains and bodies are fixated on ensuring 
immediate survival. HH, as a child, is especially vulnerable to the effects of toxic stress 

https://journalofethics.ama-assn.org/article/art-therapy-children-who-have-survived-disaster/2010-09
https://journalofethics.ama-assn.org/article/juvenile-forensic-psychiatric-evaluations/2013-10
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because he is still undergoing major brain development. As HH experiences toxic stress, 
survival takes priority over other normal childhood activities, such as cognitive 
development and physical growth. The trauma that HH experienced while being 
separated from their mother most likely has neurodevelopmental sequelae. During toxic 
stress, stress hormones affect the development of critical synapses and neurological 
connections that are essential to child development, learning, academic performance, 
and emotional maturation. The neurodevelopmental sequelae of toxic stress have 
physical and mental health implications that might be lifelong.11 
 
Conclusion 
HH and their mother’s situation is quite complex. Treating their basic medical and 
mental health needs requires triaging the appropriate resources. In assessing asylees’ 
social environment, needs, and current support, clinicians must evaluate their trauma 
symptoms while taking into account their capacity for emotional regulation.8 Dr A should 
consider involving an interdisciplinary or a multidisciplinary team to address HH’s and 
HH’s mother’s needs. While the involvement of such a team is not necessarily an ethical 
obligation, it certainly helps in fulfilling the ethical obligation to promote the well-being 
and best possible care of the patient. An ideal team might include behavioral therapists, 
social workers, other mental health care professionals (eg, developmental behavioral 
pediatricians, child psychiatrists) as well as schoolteachers and counselors, community 
advocacy leaders, and immigration lawyers. In the case vignette, Dr A might believe that 
referral is necessary to address HH’s and their mother’s needs—in particular, those 
related to traumatic stress or its exacerbation by asylum interviews.8 Dr A and all health 
care professionals, especially pediatricians caring for children and families who have 
experienced situations similar to those of HH and their mother, can access helpful 
information through the NCTSN.14 Although pediatricians and other health care 
professionals might perceive themselves as ill prepared to address the unmet needs of 
immigrant families, they have the resources and they have the moral and ethical 
obligation to identify these needs and refer patients to the proper resources. 
Pediatricians and all health professionals also have obligations to advocate for their 
patients and encourage local, state, and federal appropriation of resources to improve 
conditions in care settings for immigrant and refugee patients. 
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Editor's Note 
The case to which this commentary is a response was developed by the editorial 
staff. 
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